
Pharmacovigilance defined by the World Health 
Organization as 'the science and activities relating 
to detection, assessment, understanding and 
prevention of adverse effects or any other drug-
related problem' plays a key role in ensuring that 
patients receive safe drugs. Our knowledge of 
drug's adverse reactions can be increased by various 
means, including spontaneous reporting; intensive 

1monitoring and database studies.

Thalidomide was marketed in 1957 and was 
considered harmless for use in pregnancy by the 

1manufacturer . However, its use during pregnancy 
led to development of abnormal fetal and limb 

2deformities in 46 countries worldwide.  The 
thalidomide tragedy served as a catalyst for the 
formation of Uppsala Monitoring Centre (UMC) as 
the World Health Organization (WHO) 
Collaborating Centre for International Drug 
Monitoring. UMC operates the technical and 
scientific aspects of the WHO's worldwide 

3pharmacovigilance network.  Reports from adverse 
drug reactions (ADRs) are stored in a global 
database (VigiBase) and can be used by health 
professionals to evaluate the associations between 
various medications and associated ADRs. Drug 
Regulatory Authority of Pakistan (DRAP), 
established Pakistan National Pharmacovigilance 
Centre (PNPC) in 2015, under the division of 
Pharmacy Services to  provide a basic framework 
for the implementation of pharmacovigilance 
programme of Pakistan at provincial and national 

4level.  National data (VigiFlow) is  directly 
connected to WHO Global Database (VigiBase).

In ‘2011’ cases of blindness in 22 persons with 

diabetes were reported in the USA, after intravitreal 
injection of Avastin (Bevacizumab) for treatment of 

5wet age related macular degeneration.  Most 
recently, more than 20 persons were rendered blind 
as unregulated drug wreak havoc following off-
label intravitreal administration of Avastin 
(Bevacizumab) injection 1.25mg/0.05ml dose 
under unhygienic conditions, as mentioned by 
regulators in Pakistan. This product is approved by 
the Drug Regulatory Authority of Pakistan (DRAP) 
to treat Colorectal and other metastatic carcinomas 
in 400mg/16ml and 100mg/ 4ml preparations. The 
use of this drug product in diabetic retinopathy or 
other ophthalmic conditions is not approved by 
DRAP. The incident is linked with the 
alteration/dispensing/dilution and sale of Avastin 
100mg/4mL Injection under unhygienic/non-sterile 
conditions illegally and without any Drug 
Sale/Dispensing License (DSL) from Provincial 
Health Authority. There is no escape from 
monitoring the adverse effects, once the treatment 
has been started. In case of enteral routes, the 
management of adverse effects is possible in most 
scenarios, while, periocular routes (intravitreal) 
may lead to an irreversible damage to any ocular 
tissue (blindness caused by Avastin).

Proponents of off label use of avastin advocate that 
alternate drugs i.e Ranibizumab and Aflibercept 
cost very high as compared to Bevacizumab. The 
drug (Bevacizumab) is effective when used off-

6label , however, when it is dispensed/diluted/ 
repacked in 1.25mg/0.05ml dose from bulk 
container under unhygienic conditions and in an un-
approved manner, its safety cannot be ascertained, 
which may lead to damage and loss of vision in the 
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CALL TO ACTION

patients. Sterile areas with safety cabinets, 
unidirectional air flow systems and High Efficiency 
Particulate air filters are the part and parcel for a 
secure aseptic filling of unit doses. Moreover, the 
sterility test must be applied to the finished product. 

1. Pharmacovigilance education is essential since 
availability of counterfeit and unregistered drugs 
and resultant adverse drug reactions (ADRs) pose a 
serious health problem and contribute to 
unnecessary patient burden and hospital 
admissions. 

2. Establish Infrastructure to implement Good 
Manufacturing Practices for aseptic filling.

6. Mass media can play a significant role in 
educating communities.
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4. Pharmaceutical companies should device an 
authentic system to monitor the adverse effects as a 
part of post marketing surveillance.

3. Our future healthcare providers should therefore 
acquire an adequate set of pharmacovigilance 
competencies to rationally prescribe, distribute, and 
monitor drugs. 

5. Barriers should be minimized by regular 
trainings, easy to fill performs, rewards and 
appreciation for reporting.
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some of the barriers to comply with Pharma-
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should ensure the implementation of Pharma-
covigilance guidelines to halt such devastating 
incidents to be evident in future.
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